

**City of Yuma
General Printing Services
Bid #2019-20000015**

DESCRIPTION	Alpha Graphics Tucson, AZ			D and L Press Phoenix, AZ			Press Journal Printing Tucson, AZ			Printing Specialist Tempe, AZ			Print Zoom, LLC Yuma, AZ			Production Allstars Yuma, AZ			Roitman Graphics LLC Phoenix, AZ			Sun Graphics Printing, Inc. Yuma, AZ			Variable Inola, OK		
	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+			
1. MEMO CARDS																											
A. 4" X 6"; 4/4 Color - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 0.0550	\$ 0.0380	\$ 0.0340	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1350	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.1990	\$ 0.0415	\$ 0.0412	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.1522	\$ 0.1151	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.0600	\$ 0.1890	\$ 0.0615	\$ 0.0570
B. 4" X 6"; 4/4 Color - 16pt C2S Stock	\$ 0.0600	\$ 0.0450	\$ 0.0380	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.2300	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.2060	\$ 0.0523	\$ 0.0419	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.0900	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.2680	\$ 0.0899	\$ 0.0717	\$ 0.0900	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.1890	\$ 0.0615	\$ 0.0570
C. 8.5" X 3.5"; 4/4 - 10pt C2S Stock	\$ 0.0880	\$ 0.0570	\$ 0.0490	\$ 0.3300	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1350	\$ 0.2991	\$ 0.0606	\$ 0.0486	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.0900	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.1522	\$ 0.1151	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.2880	\$ 0.0900	\$ 0.0788
D. 4" X 6"; 4/4 Color - 100# Gloss Cover Stock	\$ 0.0780	\$ 0.0470	\$ 0.0400	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1350	\$ 0.1990	\$ 0.0415	\$ 0.0412	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.0797	\$ 0.0619	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.0600	\$ 0.1890	\$ 0.0615	\$ 0.0570
E. 5" X 7"; 4/4 Color - 14pt Gloss Cover Stock	\$ 0.0870	\$ 0.0560	\$ 0.0400	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2300	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.1995	\$ 0.0781	\$ 0.0625	\$ 0.3200	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.3580	\$ 0.1196	\$ 0.1235	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.2820	\$ 0.1065	\$ 0.0900
F. 5" X 7"; 4/0 Color - 14pt Gloss Cover Stock	\$ 0.0760	\$ 0.0510	\$ 0.0370	\$ 0.3400	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1662	\$ 0.6900	\$ 0.0552	\$ 0.2800	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.2680	\$ 0.1196	\$ 0.1375	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.2820	\$ 0.1065	\$ 0.0900
G. 5.5" X 8.5"; 4/4 Color - 14pt Gloss Cover Stock	\$ 0.0980	\$ 0.0680	\$ 0.0480	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.2350	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.2528	\$ 0.1006	\$ 0.0805	\$ 0.2700	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.3300	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.3580	\$ 0.1196	\$ 0.1235	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.3780	\$ 0.1320	\$ 0.1118
H. 5.5" X 8.5"; 4/0 Color - 14pt Gloss Cover Stock	\$ 0.0840	\$ 0.0600	\$ 0.0430	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.1950	\$ 0.2028	\$ 0.0881	\$ 0.0705	\$ 0.2300	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.3300	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.2680	\$ 0.1196	\$ 0.1235	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.3780	\$ 0.1320	\$ 0.1118
2. CALENDARS																											
A. 8.5" X 11"; 4/4 Color - 32# Text Stock	\$ 1.4000	\$ 0.9200	\$ 0.8900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.1500	\$ 2.0500	\$ 2.0000	\$ 2.9300	\$ 1.0435	\$ 0.8400	\$ 0.3300	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1800	\$ 3.4800	\$ 1.8500	\$ 1.2500	\$ 3.7860	\$ 2.1430	\$ 1.6295	\$ 3.4200	\$ 2.8000	\$ 2.2000	\$ 5.7900	\$ 1.8810	\$ 1.7624
B. 8.5" X 11"; 4/4 Color - 100# Gloss Text	\$ 1.5400	\$ 0.9810	\$ 0.9500	\$ 5.6000	\$ 1.6100	\$ 1.3500	\$ 2.3500	\$ 2.2500	\$ 2.1500	\$ 3.0160	\$ 1.0740	\$ 0.8650	\$ 0.3300	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1800	\$ 3.4800	\$ 1.8500	\$ 1.2500	\$ 4.1010	\$ 2.4430	\$ 2.0065	\$ 3.3900	\$ 2.7900	\$ 2.1900	\$ 5.7900	\$ 1.8810	\$ 1.7624
3. BROCHURES																											
A. 8.5" X 11" Trifold; 4/4 Color - 32# Gloss Text Stock																											
B. 8.5" X 11" Trifold; 1/1 Color - 32# Gloss Text Stock																											
C. 8.5" X 11" Trifold; 4/4 Color - 80# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.1240	\$ 0.0870	\$ 0.0810	\$ 0.6100	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.2260	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1626	\$ 0.1170	\$ 0.0936	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.4600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.6480	\$ 0.3805	\$ 0.2800	\$ 0.3500	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.5700	\$ 0.1590	\$ 0.1290
D. 8.5" X 11" Trifold; 1/1 Color - 80# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.1140	\$ 0.0770	\$ 0.0710	\$ 0.5500	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1118	\$ 0.0818	\$ 0.0757	\$ 0.3200	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.4600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.5400	\$ 0.3515	\$ 0.2380	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.5700	\$ 0.1590	\$ 0.1290
E. 8.5" X 11" Trifold; 4/4 Color with bleed - 100# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.0940	\$ 0.0620	\$ 0.0600	\$ 0.6200	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.2700	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.3093	\$ 0.1206	\$ 0.0965	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.2300	\$ 1.1600	\$ 0.5800	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.6660	\$ 0.2129	\$ 0.1470	\$ 0.3700	\$ 0.3100	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.5700	\$ 0.1590	\$ 0.1290
F. 8.5" X 11" Trifold; 1/1 Color with bleed - 100# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.0840	\$ 0.0520	\$ 0.0500	\$ 0.5600	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1118	\$ 0.0859	\$ 0.0797	\$ 0.3400	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.4600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.5580	\$ 0.3660	\$ 0.2520	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.5700	\$ 0.1590	\$ 0.1290
G. 8.5" X 14" Trifold; 4/4 Color with bleed - 100# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.1760	\$ 0.1140	\$ 0.1110	\$ 0.7800	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2700	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.5317	\$ 0.1840	\$ 0.1472	\$ 0.5800	\$ 0.4100	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.6800	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.9900	\$ 0.3141	\$ 0.2167	\$ 0.6400	\$ 0.5300	\$ 0.4300	\$ 0.8760	\$ 0.2610	\$ 0.1950
H. 8.5" X 14" Trifold; 1/1 Color with bleed - 100# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.1660	\$ 0.1040	\$ 0.1010	\$ 0.7000	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.2300	\$ 0.2350	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.1647	\$ 0.1332	\$ 0.1218	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.6800	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.8280	\$ 0.5255	\$ 0.3500	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.8760	\$ 0.2610	\$ 0.1950
I. 11" X 17" Trifold; 4/4 Color with bleed - 100# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.2480	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.8000	\$ 0.3200	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2700	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.7847	\$ 0.2714	\$ 0.2171	\$ 0.5800	\$ 0.4100	\$ 0.3800	\$ 1.1600	\$ 0.5800	\$ 0.3800	\$ 1.0300	\$ 0.4485	\$ 0.2825	\$ 0.6400	\$ 0.5300	\$ 0.4300	\$ 1.9800	\$ 0.4035	\$ 0.2895
J. 11" X 17" Trifold; 1/1 Color with bleed - 100# Gloss Text Stock	\$ 0.2380	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.7200	\$ 0.3200	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1647	\$ 0.1332	\$ 0.1218	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2100	\$ 1.1600	\$ 0.5800	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.8680	\$ 0.5065	\$ 0.3575	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1900	\$ 1.9800	\$ 0.4035	\$ 0.2895
K. 8.5" X 11" Folded; 1/1 Color - 70# Text	\$ 0.0880	\$ 0.0570	\$ 0.0440	\$ 0.6100	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1200	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.0600	\$ 0.1188	\$ 0.0857	\$ 0.0812	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.4200	\$ 0.2300	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.5400	\$ 0.3515	\$ 0.2800	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0900	\$ 0.0800	\$ 1.2840	\$ 0.3945	\$ 0.2798
L. 4" X 11.5" Folded; 4/4 Color - 16pt C2S Stock																											
4. POSTERS / FLYERS																											
A. 11" X 17"; 4/0 Color - 100# Matte Cover Stock	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1230	\$ 0.1080	\$ 0.7700	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.1450	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.8474	\$ 0.2827	\$ 0.2545	\$ 0.5000	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.3700	\$ 0.8900	\$ 0.6400	\$ 0.4700	\$ 0.6340	\$ 0.4050	\$ 0.4975	\$ 0.4800	\$ 0.4300	\$ 0.3800	\$ 1.4580	\$ 0.4275	\$ 0.3593
B. 11" X 17"; 4/0 Color - 100# Gloss Cover Stock	\$ 0.2190	\$ 0.1710	\$ 0.1560	\$ 0.7700	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1450	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.8093	\$ 0.2648	\$ 0.2295	\$ 0.4900	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.8200	\$ 0.4200	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.6340	\$ 0.4050	\$ 0.2362	\$ 0.4500	\$ 0.4000	\$ 0.3500	\$ 1.4580	\$ 0.4275	\$ 0.3593
C. 11" X 17"; 4/0 Color - 10pt C2S Stock	\$ 0.2090	\$ 0.1610	\$ 0.1460	\$ 0.7700	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2950	\$ 0.2850	\$ 0.2700	\$ 0.9436	\$ 0.3282	\$ 0.2996	\$ 0.5000	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.3700	\$ 0.8200	\$ 0.4200	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.9580	\$ 0.2884	\$ 0.1745	\$ 0.4800	\$ 0.4200	\$ 0.3700	\$ 1.4580	\$ 0.4275	\$ 0.3593
D. 11" X 17"; 4/0 Color - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 0.2190	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.0156	\$ 0.7700	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2850	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.9436	\$ 0.3282	\$ 0.2996	\$ 0.4900	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.8200	\$ 0.4200	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.9580	\$ 0.6370	\$ 0.3295	\$ 0.4300	\$ 0.3800	\$ 0.3200	\$ 1.4580	\$ 0.4275	\$ 0.3593
E. 11" X 17"; 1/1 Color - 70# Text Stock	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.5200	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.1000	\$ 0.0900	\$ 0.0800	\$ 0.2485	\$ 0.1071	\$ 0.1015	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.8200	\$ 0.4200	\$ 0.3000	\$ 0.8140	\$ 0.5355	\$ 0.2315	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 1.1760	\$ 0.3270	\$ 0.2445
F. 8.5" X 11"; 4/0 Color - 80# Gloss Text	\$ 0.0700	\$ 0.0490	\$ 0.0430	\$ 0.3700	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1400	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.2263	\$ 0.0894	\$ 0.0715	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.3400	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1100	\$ 0.6300	\$ 0.2645	\$ 0.2075	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.1500	\$ 0.1300	\$ 0.4620	\$ 0.1215	\$ 0.1020

This information is not the official results but is for informational purposes only. Please contact the Purchasing Division for further information.

**City of Yuma
General Printing Services
Bid #2019-20000015**

DESCRIPTION	Alpha Graphics Tucson, AZ			D and L Press Phoenix, AZ			Press Journal Printing Tucson, AZ			Printing Specialist Tempe, AZ			Print Zoom, LLC Yuma, AZ			Production Allstars Yuma, AZ			Roitman Graphics LLC Phoenix, AZ			Sun Graphics Printing, Inc. Yuma, AZ			Variable Inola, OK			
	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	QTY 251-999	QTY 1000-1999	QTY 2000+	
G. 28" X 24"; 1/0 Color with bleed - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 0.9800	\$ 0.7150	\$ 0.6240	\$ 6.0000	\$ 2.2500	\$ 1.6500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.0025	\$ 1.3244	\$ 1.3024	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.8600	\$ 1.8600	\$ 1.0800	\$ 4.5955	\$ 3.9210	\$ 3.6900	\$ 9.6500	\$ 9.6500	\$ 9.6500	\$ 6.2940	\$ 1.7145	\$ 1.7145	
H. 28" X 24"; 4/0 Color with bleed - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 1.0400	\$ 0.7440	\$ 0.6450	\$ 6.0000	\$ 2.2500	\$ 1.6500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.0025	\$ 1.3244	\$ 1.3024	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.8600	\$ 1.8600	\$ 1.0800	\$ 4.5955	\$ 3.9210	\$ 3.6900	\$ 13.8500	\$ 13.8500	\$ 13.8500	\$ 6.2940	\$ 1.7145	\$ 1.7145	
I. 36" X 24"; 1/0 Color with bleed - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 0.9800	\$ 0.7150	\$ 0.6240	\$ 6.0000	\$ 2.2500	\$ 1.6500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9984	\$ 1.3234	\$ 1.3124	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.8600	\$ 1.8600	\$ 1.0800	\$ 7.6410	\$ 6.9570	\$ 6.5415	\$ 10.8000	\$ 10.8000	\$ 10.8000	\$ 6.4800	\$ 1.8675	\$ 1.8675	
J. 36" X 24"; 4/0 Color with bleed - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 1.0400	\$ 0.7440	\$ 0.6450	\$ 6.0000	\$ 2.2500	\$ 1.6500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9984	\$ 1.3234	\$ 1.3124	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.8600	\$ 1.8600	\$ 1.0800	\$ 7.6410	\$ 6.9570	\$ 6.5415	\$ 16.0000	\$ 16.0000	\$ 16.0000	\$ 6.4800	\$ 1.8675	\$ 1.8675	
K. 40" X 30"; 1/0 Color with bleed - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 27.50	\$ 26.00	\$ 25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.42	\$ 2.26	\$ 1.31	\$ 7.6410	\$ 6.9570	\$ 6.5415	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 19.2960	\$ 19.2960	\$ 19.2960	
L. 40" X 30"; 4/0 Color with bleed - 10pt C1S Stock	\$ 26.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.42	\$ 2.26	\$ 1.31	\$ 7.6410	\$ 6.9570	\$ 6.5415	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 19.2960	\$ 19.2960	\$ 19.2960	
5. DOOR HANGERS																												
4.25" X 11"; 4/4 Color, 16 pt Stock, matte finish - A. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.	\$ 0.2060	\$ 0.1440	\$ 0.1220	\$ 0.8400	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3334	\$ 0.1360	\$ 0.1088	\$ 0.7900	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.5200	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.7000	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.2915	\$ 0.3100	\$ 0.2800	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.6720	\$ 0.1545	\$ 0.1305	
4.25" X 11"; 4/4 Color, 16 pt Stock, gloss finish - B. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.	\$ 0.1960	\$ 0.1340	\$ 0.1120	\$ 0.8400	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3805	\$ 0.1431	\$ 0.1145	\$ 0.7900	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.5200	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.7000	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.2915	\$ 0.3600	\$ 0.3400	\$ 0.3100	\$ 0.4800	\$ 0.1410	\$ 0.1215	
4.25" X 11"; 1/1 Color, 16 pt Stock, matte finish - C. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.	\$ 0.1860	\$ 0.1024	\$ 0.1020	\$ 0.8400	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3334	\$ 0.1360	\$ 0.1088	\$ 0.7900	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.5200	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.5920	\$ 0.3175	\$ 0.2495	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1800	\$ 0.6720	\$ 0.1545	\$ 0.1305	
4.25" X 11"; 1/1 Color, 16 pt Stock, gloss finish - D. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.	\$ 0.1760	\$ 0.1140	\$ 0.0920	\$ 0.8400	\$ 0.1700	\$ 0.1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3805	\$ 0.1431	\$ 0.1145	\$ 0.7900	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.5200	\$ 0.2900	\$ 0.2100	\$ 0.7000	\$ 0.3900	\$ 0.2915	\$ 0.2600	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.2500	\$ 0.4800	\$ 0.1410	\$ 0.1215	
6. BANNERS																												
4' X 8' 13 oz. Scrim Vinyl, 4/0 Color, UV and A. Waterproof, Taped Hemmed. Banner to include wind slits and grommets.			57.00	No Bid				69.40		138.90				90.00			91.99			85.00			114.00			92.00		
4.25" X 11"; 4/4 Color, 16 pt Stock, gloss finish - B. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.			57.00	No Bid				59.40		138.90				90.00			91.99			85.00			114.00			92.00		
4.25" X 11"; 1/1 Color, 16 pt Stock, matte finish - C. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.			60.00			87.00		89.20		83.87			No Bid				91.99			85.00			154.00			92.00		
4.25" X 11"; 1/1 Color, 16 pt Stock, gloss finish - D. contains notch and hole to hang on on multiple variations of door knobs.			60.00			87.00		84.00		83.87			No Bid				91.99			85.00			154.00			92.00		
7. HOURLY RATE																												
A. In the event an hourly rate is required for a specific job.			40.00			75.00		25.00		53.30				60.00			100.00			75.00			80.00					-