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CITY OF YUMA

Vehicle Upholstery Services
Bid #2016-20000065

Reupholster and Repad Bench Seat
Reupholster Molded Bucket Seat Unit(s)
Reupholster and Repad Bottom Seat
Reupholster Molded Bench Seat
Reupholster Molded Bucket Seat(s)
Replace Recliner Bracket

Reline Headliner

Recover Visors

Welding Seat/Frame (Include re-pad)
Custom Made Floor Mats

Custom Made Dash Mats

Install Carpet Including Padding

Install Rubber Kit with Pad - Front
Install Rubber Kit with Pad - Rear
Reinforcement of the driver's of the seat

N/B=No Bid

Auto
$330.00
$220.00
$155.00
$165.00
$155.00

$85.00
$200.00
$70.00
$160.00
$75.00
$45.00
$200.00
$115.00
$115.00
$115.00

ZAVALA UPHOLSTERY
Yuma, AZ

Light/Heavy Truck
$330.00
$220.00
$175.00
$165.00
$155.00

$85.00
$185.00
$80.00
$125.00
$65.00
$45.00
$195.00
$145.00
$115.00
$115.00
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Off Road Equipment
No Bid
$85.00
$85.00

$115.00
$145.00
$115.00
$200.00
$70.00
$140.00
$160.00
No Bid
No Bid
$160.00
No Bid
$115.00

This information is not the official results but is for informational purposes only. Please contact the Purchasing Division for further information.



